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Group 1 1ea. UNIT
TKN Digestion Block with Heat Deflector Shield and Insert Rack and PRICE 4,278.50 10,228.24
with 1 year warranty MFG SCP Science Part No. 010-520-225 or approved equal |TOTAL 4,278.50 NO BID 10,228.24 NO BID
SCP Science Gerhardt
1. Manufacturer/Part No. Mfr/Part No. 010-520-225 12-0725
1ea. UNIT
Multi-step Programmable Controller with 1 year warranty MFG SCP PRICE 2,781.00
Science Part No. 010-500-250 or approved equal TOTAL 2,781.00 NO BID Included NO BID
SCP Science
2. Manufacturer/Part No. Mfr/Part No. 010-500-250
1 ea. PRICE 1,473.00
Exhaust Manifold MFG SCCP Science Part No.: 010-520-250 or approved equal |[TOTAL 1,473.00 NO BID Included NO BID
SCP Science
3. Manufacturer/Part No. Mfr/Part No. 010-520-250
20 ea. UNIT 18.20
Glassware, MFG Gerhardt Part No.: 12-0301 NO SUBSTITUTES TOTAL 364.00 NO BID Included NO BID
SCP Science
4, Manufacturer/Part No. Mfr/Part No. 010-520-031
*
TOTAL GROUP 1 TOTAL 8,896.50 NO BID 10,228.24 NO BID
Group 2 2 ea. UNIT
Digestion Block, 100 mL Sample Capacity with Transfer Racks and with 1 PRICE 2,783.25 3,300.00 3,523.53
year warranty MFG SCP Science Part No. 010-501-230 or approved equal TOTAL 5,566.50 6,600.00 7,047.06 NO BID
SCP Science Env. Express Env. Express
1. Manufacturer/Part No. Mir/Part No. 010-501-230 SCISI SC2100-35
2 ea. UNIT
Temperature Controller (if applicable) with 1 year warranty MFG SCP PRICE 1,231.00 1,035.30
Science Partr No. 010-500-220 or approved equal TOTAL 2,462.00 Included 2,070.60 NO BID
SCP Science Env. Express Env. Express
2. Manufacturer/Part No. Mfr/Part No. 010-500-220 SCISI SC1831
*
TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 8,028.50 6,600.00 9,117.66 NO BID
Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 7-8 days 10 days 6 weeks
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Ana Laboratories Fox Scientific Demandstar
Analytical Scientific Pace Labs SAWS Website
Anatek Labs Seal Analytical

Baytech Supply
Capitol Scientific
Environmental Express

Seigniory Chemical Products Ltd

Thomas Scientific




